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Site 
Code 

Site Name Grid 
Refere
nce 

Size Main 
Habitats 

LBAP 
Priority 
Habitats / 
Species 

Full description Wildlife 
Site 
Qualifying 
Features 

WS/SO4
0/46 

Brook Hill 
House Field 

SO497
090 

0.90 
ha 

Species rich 
neutral 
Grassland/ 
Marshy 
Grassland 
M27 
Filipendula 
ulmaria- 
Angelica 
sylvestris 
mire 

Lowland 
species-
Rich 
Grassland 
(HAP) 

Overgrown Filipendula ulmaria - 
Angelica sylvestris mire, bordered by 
woodland/neglected hedgerows.  
Moderately sloping field, facing north-
west.  Damp/marshy grassland, 
comprising abundant Filipendula 
ulmaria and Angelica sylvestris, 
Centaurea nigra and Juncus 
articulatus, locally frequent 
Dactylorhiza fuchsii, Ajuga reptans, 
Alchemilla vulgaris, Lathyrus pratensis, 
Lysimachia nummularia, Potentilla 
reptans.  Occasional Lychnis flos-
cuculi, Vicia cracca, Primula vulgaris, 
Equisetum spp. Field edges comprising 
locally frequent bracken, bramble, and 
willow scrub.  Sward height approx. 40-
50cm.  Stream runs along north-
eastern edge of field. Owners are keen 
on wildlife management and are Gwent 
Wildlife Trust members.  The field is 
grazed by sheep occasionally.   A 
small field to the north of the main field 
is semi-improved with some evidence 
of disturbance. 

H4 Neutral 
Grasslands 
H7 Marshy 
Grasslands 

 


